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New Delhi, Seplembe|l: On his appoinhent as Director on the Board of Bharat Heavy
Electricals Limited, lrr. Amitabh Mathlr, 57, has assumed chargs as Director (lndustrial
systems & Producis) of the MahaEtna Public Sector engineering and manlfacturins
enterprbe, here today,

Prio. to this, he was heading the company's Power Seclor East€rn R.gion (PSER),
Kolkata as Executive Director. A ir.chanicrl ongln€€r from D6lhi Colleg€ ofEngineeri.g,
iIBA rrom Faculty of l'bnagenent Studies, Delhiand an atlmnus ofDelhiPublic School,
irathura Road, Mr. Mathu. has mo.e than 34 yearc of dch profe3sion.l eqerienc6 in
having handled diveFe functions in BHEL viz. itarketins, Ausin€s developnent
Corpo.ate Affans, Prcject Management & Execution in BHEL.

Mr. Itathur was elevated to the position of Executiv€ Dir€ctor in January 2014.
Signincantly, under his leadeFhip, Eastern Resion in BHEL created new benchmarks in
project execution. During his stint at PSER, Mr, Mathur successfully handled more than
1l:l project sites onder various at ges of implem.nlation across the country and abroad
bolh in powar as wellas industrjal 8egment5.

Starting his caree. in aHEL as an EngineerTEinee in 1981, he acquied ktrowledge ofall
major products in the Utility as well as Caplive segmen6, Ea ier, as part of the Pow€r
Sector Marketing, Mr, Mathur had an impressive tEck.ecord ofbGine6! developne.ti.
largesizeCoal, Hydel& Gas Power Pla.ts onTurnkey/EPc basis.

His hands{n erperience in ma*et intellisence, idenlitying businoss opportunities,
development of strategies and relationship building resulted in the company secudng
orde6 of around 16,000 MW from a brcad base of custome.s comprising lPPs and
centraustats utilities in a highly comp6titiv6 6nvircnment during his tenure in itarkeiing,
He also speahoaded the conmlttee to develop a standard proposalfor 350 irw ETG and
CCPP package cohprising 9FA Gas Turbine8with matchlng ,uxlllrdes.
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